
ITEM Quantity/ Box Item # Staple Clean Star Unipak
Osceola 
Supply

Central 
Poly

TRASH BAGS/CAN 
LINERS

24X32 BLACK .5 MIL 500/box CP2432KM $22.50 $27.85 $16.50 $22.50 $17.36

24X33 BLACK 1 MIL 150/box RM2432H-150 $59.98 $27.85 $29.90 $12.45 $31.68

33X39 BLACK 2 MIL 100/box RM3339H $31.25 $12.75 $19.00 $16.75 $20.59
38X58 BLACK 2 MIL 100/box 3036XHW $42.99 $23.50 $29.00 $29.75 $35.26
30X36 WHITE XHEAVY 200/box INT-3036-XH $31.99 $25.75 $25.00 $23.75 $14.82
38X58 WHITE XHEAVY 100/box CP3858WXH $27.99 No Bid $25.00 $23.00 $16.10
30 GALLON, MEDIUM DUTY, 30X36, .50 MIL 200/case INT-3037-H No Bid $25.75 $25.00 $19.15 $13.80

60 GALLON,  XHEAVY DUTY, GUSSETTED, 38X60, 0.8 MIL 100/case INT-3860-X-HVY $29.99 No Bid $25.00 $24.97 $17.69

60 GALLON, HEAVY DUTY, GUSSETTED, 38X60,  1.5 MIL 100/case 608 $34.99 No Bid $35.00 $29.75 $27.36

SANITARY NAPKIN CAN LINER 500/box HOSPECOH5614
1 $12.50 $27.50 $20.68 No Bid

8 QT BEIGE MEDIUM WASTEBASKET each BWK28-BLA No Bid $8.30 $8.35 No Bid

Paper Products MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWELS, BROWN, 9.5” X 9.1” 4000/case GEN1508 $25.99 $19.40 $20.75 $26.00
HOUSE HOLD PAPER TOWELS 2-PLY 30 pks of 85 per cs 1220-85 $29.99 $25.35 $25.50 $30.00
TOILET TISSUE 2-PLY, 500 SHEETS/ROLL, MIN. 4”x 4” 96 rolls/case 13-800 $54.34 $33.00 $34.00 $55.00
WYPALL X60 TERI WIPER POP UP,  9.1X16.8 10 bx of 126 per cs N-P060IDW $87.47 $92.50 $86.00
WYPALL X80 TOWELS 200/box BWKN8140 $31.13 $25.40 $33.00
PAPER TOWEL, ROLL TYPE, BLEACHED, 8” X 350’ 12/case 835B $35.85 $28.50 $33.96 $28.12
PAPER TOWEL, ROLL TYPE, UNBLEACHED, 8” X 350” 12/case BWK6252 $30.51 $24.80 $29.73 $27.12

Mops/Brooms/Brush
es

60” TAPERED WOOD HANDLE each 90001 $27.99 $5.35 $3.72

60” METAL TIP WOOD HANDLE each BWK136 $4.99 $4.85 $5.75
60" MOP HANDLE, METAL TIP, FEMALE each BWK834 No Bid $7.30 $6.36
60” MOP HANDLE, CLIP-ON each 1490 No Bid $10.95 $6.99
10” TRUCK WASH BRUSH each BWK8410 No Bid $12.67 $18.15
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WAREHOUSE CORN BROOM each 920Y $9.99 $7.50 $5.26
LARGE ANGLE BROOM, PLASTIC each 932A $5.99 $7.67 $4.99
RAYON WEBFOOT MOPHEAD, 16oz each RM33245 $4.99 $4.40 $4.82
LAYFLAT MOPHEAD, SCREW-IN, 16oz each CM22016 $9.99 $4.95 $4.75
20” WHITE POLISHING PAD 5/pack 4120 $35.20 $17.70 $16.50
20” BLACK HIGH PERFORMANCE STRIP PADS 5/pack 7220 $23.99 $24.35 $16.50
20” RED BUFFING PADS 5/pack 5120 $20.99 $17.70 $16.50
20” NATURAL TAN HOG’S HAIR BURNISHING PADS 5/PK 3520 No Bid $18.80 $16.75
MOP HEAD, 16 OZ, RAYON LAYFLAT each 32165 No Bid $5.65 $4.75
5”X24” DUST MOP HEAD each 524-1EA $13.82 $6.85 $5.10
5”x24” DUST MOP FRAME each 524F $3.49 $5.35 $4.62
30” FLOOR SQUEEGIE each BH14003 $25.99 $22.50 $18.00
WIRE TOILET BOWL BRUSH, WOOD HANDLE each BH18001 No Bid $4.00 $2.50
WINDOW SQUEEGIE each BH15006 $39.99 $4.70 $9.15
MOP BUCKET SET each T010095PW $50.74 $68.75 $78.00
DIRTY WATER BUCKET, 18 QT NO WRINGER each FG2614 No Bid $26.00 $19.99
ROUND DUSTER each COBW0 No Bid $9.20 $8.50
HEAVY DUTY DUST PAN each IMP710 $4.99 $2.48 $4.75
20" PLUNGER, WOOD, HANDLE, BLACK each UNS100 No Bid $5.08 $4.50
19" CARPET BONNET each 1146-19SEA No Bid $40.50 $28.95

Chemicals DIAL PUMP GOLD ANTI-BACTERIAL, REFILL 4 gal./case 5031-420-02 $75.96 $44.50 $53.75
DIAL ANTIBACTERIAL  LIQUID HAND SOAP 7.5 OZ BOTTLES 12 -7.5 oz btls/case DIA84014CT No Bid $37.00 $59.10
SOFTSOAP SOOTHING ALOE VERA HAND SOAP REFILL 4-1 gal/case 4330-4 No Bid $57.00 $58.00
HAND SANITIZER, ECONOMY SZ 4-2 liter btls/case 5015-04 No Bid $70.50 $63.50
HAND SANITIZER, 8 OZ. 12-8 oz/case 3659-12 No Bid $44.50 $39.75
DISINFECTANT BOWL  CLEANER 12 qts/ per case 9225-32 $34.99 $23.70 $26.00
THICKENED BOWL/TILE CLEANER 12 quarts per case 5503-32 $34.99 $31.75 $35.00
TIDE 36# CLEANER each $29.99 $26.50 $36.00
DAWN DISH DETERGENT 8-38 oz/case PGC45112CT $49.99 $46.25 $49.99
CASCADE DISHWASHER DETERGENT, POWDER 7-75 oz/case 59535 No Bid $72.25 $68.00
TILEX SOAP SCUM REMOVER 12-32 oz. btls/cs 101104392 No Bid $50.95 $54.00

MOLD & MILDEW STAIN REMOVER 12-32 oz/case ZPEZUMILDEW3
2CT No Bid $42.50 $47.50

LEMON DETERGENT DISINFECTANT 4-1 gal/case 62504 No Bid $36.00 $49.95
BIO-ENZYMATIC DIGESTANT, CLEANER & DEODORIZER 12 qt/case 7524-4 No Bid $38.25 $39.95
GOLD & KLEEN ANTI-MICROBIAL REFILLS 12 800 ml. btls/case 4330-27 No Bid $49.25 $44.65
NON-AMMONIA FLOOR STRIPPER 5 gal. pail CSP514E $76.99 $45.50 $54.00

FLOOR SEALANT #117 5 gal. pail ZPEZUFSLR128C
T $79.99 $70.25 $73.00

MIRROR FINISH FLOOR WAX 5 gal. pail ULTRA25 $3.33 $72.50 $82.00
PINE CLEANER, CONCENTRATED 4 gal/case BWK4734 No Bid $33.25 $39.95
BLEACH, CHLORINE TYPE, LIQUID, CLO WHITE OR EQUAL 6/gallons 3575047 $25.99 $22.50 $26.00
GLASS CLEANER 12-19 oz. btls/cs CHP5151 $42.99 $38.75 $43.00



FOAMING AEROSOL GLASS CLEANER 12-20 oz cans/cs 3207-20 $27.98 $38.75 $39.00
FOAMING GERMICIDAL CLEANER 12-20 oz cans/cs 3205-20 No Bid $42.50 $49.00
AJAX BLEACH CLEANER 24/bx CPC14278CT $43.41 $37.50 $43.00
LAVA PUMICE BAR 48/bx WDF10383 No Bid $68.75 $57.98
STAINLESS STEEL POLISH OIL 12-20 oz. btls/cs 4111 $62.16 $48.25 $65.00
AEROSOL AIR FRESHENER REFILLS 7 OZ. 12-7 oz. cans/oz 7908 $37.98 $45.50 $54.00
DISINFECTANT SPRAY 12-15 oz. cans/cs 4104 $43.98 $48.25 $57.00
ODOR NEUTRALIZER SPRAY 12 qts./cs 7750-32 $25.98 $46.50 $31.00
ODOR ELIMINATOR CONCENTRATED 1 gal 4/cs 7776-4 No Bid No Bid $43.00
HEAVY DUTY DEGREASER 2-1 gal. bottles/cs 5225-4 $51.99 $36.50 $28.00
BULLDOZER A/P CLEANER 12-32 oz. btls/cs 051000-12 No Bid $36.50 $43.25
CLEANSER, AJAX OR EQUAL 30/case CPC14278CT No Bid $37.50 $43.00
PINK BOWL BLOCKS 12/case BWKU04BX No Bid $11.10 $17.00
SPRING LINEN AIR FRESHENER 12-20 oz cans/cs CHP5176 No Bid $23.50 $62.00
LEMON FURNITURE POLISH 12-20 oz cans/cs CHP5136 No Bid $51.25 $58.00
SHEILA SHINE STAINLESS STEEL POLISH 12-10 oz cans/cs 3707-20 No Bid $85.25 $63.00

Misc. AEROSOL AIR FRESHENER DISPENSERS (FOR 7 OZ. REFILLS) each CL-7MAD No Bid $23.75 $21.00
CAR WASH 55 gal. drum 112906 No Bid $280.00 $295.00
PREMIUM SCRUBBING SPONGE 20/pk 174 $55.63 $16.00 $14.92
COTTON CLEANING RAGS 25# 537-10 No Bid $43.25 $30.00
3” CASTOR DOLLY each BWKDOLLY No Bid $27.05 $40.75
VINYL TIRE DRESSING 4 gal/cs 642941PA No Bid No Bid $144.00
POLY. GLOVES, MED 1000/cs GLX370M 6.98/14.00 No Bid $38.00 $3.95
POLY. GLOVES, LRG 1000/cs GLX370L 6.98/14.00 No Bid $38.00 $3.95
POLY. GLOVES, X-LRG 1000/cs GLX370XL No Bid No Bid $38.00 $3.95
PWDR FREE VINYL GLOVES, LRG 1000/cs VLG5201 No Bid $21.25 $38.00 $26.00
PWDR FREE VINYL GLOVES, X-LRG 1000/cs VXL5201 $34.99 $21.25 $38.00 $26.00
GLOVES, FLOCK LINED X-LRG 12 pair/pk GLX242L No Bid No Bid $11.25
NITRILE GLOVES, 5 MIL, LRG 1000/cs NIPFT-104 $61.99 $31.50 $40.00 $46.00
NITRILE GLOVES,  5 MIL, X-LRG 1000/cs NIPFT-105 $61.99 $31.50 $40.00 $46.00
STYROFOAM CUPS, 8 OZ 1000/cs 8J8 $41.01 $29.75 $34.25
STYROFOAM CUPS, 12 OZ 1000/cs 12J12 $49.99 $42.50 $49.75
STYROFOAM CUPS, 16 OZ 500/cs 16J165 $45.17 $37.50 $73.00
PAPER CUPS, CONE, 4.5 OZ 5000/cs CFRCPCONE4 No Bid $64.00 $76.00
SPRAY BOTTLES each 5800-32 $1.49 $0.75 $0.92
SPRAY BOTTLE TRIGGERS each BWK09229 $1.49 $0.80 $0.72
URINAL SCREENS 12/cs BWK1001 $14.99 $12.23 $16.42

RESCUE ONE STEP DISINFECTANT CLEANER & Deodorizer 1 GALLON  No Bid  No Bid  $    57.00 
NABC NON-ACID DISINFECTANT BATHROOM CLEANER 
FLORAL SCENT 12/CS  No Bid  $       23.70  $    38.00 



WALL MOUNT AUTOMATIC HAND SOAP/SANITIZER 
DISPENSER 40 OZ 1 EACH No Bid No Bid 54.35$    
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