Purchasing Department
116 West Jefferson Street
Thomasville, Georgia 31799
(229)-225-4100

Project/Purchase Description: 2026 July-Dec Office Supplies

Order as Needed: Lowest Responsive and Responsible Vendor per Item (Best Value)

. . . TheT Stapl
2026 Office Supplies Tabulation July 1, 2026-December 31, 2026 e tree aples Ponders Office Depot
House Business

Sticky Notes 1% x2 12 pads/pk No Bid 1.86 3.48 5.52
3x3 12 pads/pk No Bid 4.07 5.12 7.95

3x5 12 pads/pk i
Correction Tapes & Fluid Correction tape Single Line Disposable 1 No Bid 0.99 1.92 1.59
Correction fluid Multi purpose 1 No Bid No Bid 1.88 2.59

Tape Invisible tape, refill roll %" x 1296” 10 rolls No Bid 6.78 12.96 8.94
Clear Sealing Tape 1 roll No Bid 1.02 2.78 2.37
Tape dispenser 1 No Bid

Glue Med Glue Stick 1 stick No Bid 0.29 0.92 0.96
Lgr Glue Stick 1 stick No Bid 1.33 1.98 2.89

Legal Notepads White 5x8 legal pads 12 pads/pk No Bid 2.15 13.47 4.09
Yellow 5x8 legal pads 12 pads/pk No Bid 2.70 13.44 3.49
White 8 2 x 11 legal pads 12 pads/pk No Bid 7.65 18.24 7.62
Yellow 8 2 x 11 legal pads 12 pads/pk No Bid 7.29 18.24 9.75
White 8 V2 x 14 legal pads 12 pads/pk No Bid 13.00 21.89 12.48
Yellow 8 V2 x 14 legal pads 12 pads/pk No Bid 13.00 21.89 12.48

Steno Books Green tint 70 pg 12/pk No Bid 10.79 26.49 13.37

Phone Message Books 4 up 400 sets 1 No Bid 6.99 10.49 2.32
Message pads “While You Were Out” 4x5 pink 12 No Bid

Index Cards 3 x5 ruled 100 1.54 0.55
3 x5 unruled 100 1.54 1.69
4 x 6 ruled 100 2.20 2.39




4 x 6 unruled 100 No Bid No Bid 2.20 2.39
3x5 Laser & Inkjet Avery 5388 150 No Bid 14.30 23.49 14.00
- [N "
Clasp & Coin Envelopes #3 2% x4 Y Coin Envelopes 1000 No Bid 38.49 38.49 50.00
#7 3% x 6 % Coin Envelopes, gummed 500 No Bid 15.68 52.49 36.74
#35 5x7 % 100 No Bid 16.99 41.29 31.99
#55 6x9 100 No Bid 8.80 16.00 7.88
#63 6 2 x 9% 100 No Bid 20.29 18.00 7.99
#75 7Y x10% 100 No Bid 15.00 23.00 23.09
#90 9x12 100 No Bid 9.72 17.00 9.04
#93 9% x12% 100 No Bid 17.43 25.00 11.16
#97 10x13 100 No Bid 14.26 20.00 11.02
#11012x15 % 100 No Bid 20.85 34.00 14.55
10 X 13 Interdepartment 100 No Bid 17.06 42.00 21.96

Envelopes #9 plain white 500 No Bid 16.64 29.99 13.99
#9 window 500 No Bid 17.34 65.00 33.73
#10 plain white 500 No Bid 14.77 39.89 54.39
#10 window 500 No Bid 18.27 60.00 44.79
Envelope Moisteners Envelope moistener 1 No Bid 0.39 3.69 1.79
Fingertip Moisteners Fingertip moisteners 1 No Bid 1.21 2.56 3.09
Rubber Fingertips, medium 12 No Bid 1.10 5.58 1.91

Dividers/Sheet Protectors 5 tab dividers, clear tabs 1 set No Bid 1.43 0.62 0.70
5 tab dividers, asst color tabs 1 set No Bid 0.82 2.34 0.66
8 tab dividers, clear tabs 1 set No Bid 2.18 1.25 1.25
Pre-printed tab dividers A-Z leather style 1 set No Bid 3.24 6.79 6.79
Top loading sheet protectors, clear 8 %2 x 11 100 No Bid 5.99 5.89 5.10
Side loading Sheet protectors, clear 8 72 x 11 25 No Bid 4.50 25.49 7.69

File Folders 1/3 cut letter size, manila 100 No Bid 7.88 13.36 6.47
1/3 cut letter size, red 100 No Bid 12.00 23.38 13.81
1/3 cut letter size, green 100 No Bid 12.00 23.38 13.11
1/3 cut letter size, blue 100 No Bid 12.00 23.38 12.89
1/3 cut letter size, assorted 100 No Bid 12.00 23.38 15.07
1/3 cut legal size, manila 100 No Bid 9.99 21.49 9.82
1/3 cut legal size, blue 100 No Bid 15.90 29.98 12.91




Pocket Folders

1/3 cut legal size, green 100 No Bid 15.90 29.98 44.79
1/3 cut legal size yellow 100 No Bid 15.90 29.98 31.35
Smead ET2-1522L, end tab 1/2 cut, manila 100 No Bid 29.25 32.49 27.39
Smead 152-5L, guide height 2/5 cut, manila 100 No Bid 38.09 41.00 37.49
Smead ET2-153L, end tab 1/3 cut, manila 100 No Bid 28.79 47.00 21.79

2-pocket folders, green, letter size

Hanging Files Frames letter 1 No Bid 10.67 11.40 11.40
Frames legal 1 No Bid 13.99 17.40 11.40
Legal hanging file folders (1/5) 25 No Bid 9.55 17.49 8.53
Letter hanging file folders (1/5) 25 No Bid 21.07 14.49 6.30

Expandable File Folders Wallet 3 %2 Expansion, 10x15 with elastic cord 1 No Bid 7.68 10.49 7.29
Pocket 1 %" Expansion, letter size 25 No Bid 22.07 42.00 61.19
Pocket 3 %2 Expansion, letter size 25 No Bid 7.05 47.00 30.50
Pocket 3 2 Expansion, legal size 25 No Bid 27.21 52.00 80.09
Pocket 5 V4 Expansion, letter size 10 No Bid 13.73 32.00 8.53
Pocket 5 Y4 Expansion, green, letter size 1 No Bid 6.90 7.89 10.99
Pocket 5 Y4 Expansion, legal size 10 No Bid 27.21 26.49 18.12
Jacket 1” Expansion, manila, letter size 50 No Bid 15.23 43.35 29.29
Jacket 2” Expansion, manila, letter size 50 No Bid 13.00 44.68 15.38
Expandable employee jackets 1 1/2 Expansion, 9 1/2 x 11 3/4 15 No Bid 27.39 36.63 27.39

Calculator Supplies Red/black nylon Calculator ribbon BR80C-6 1 No Bid 2.04 4.25 13.59
Porelon 42-2 Replacement Ink Rollers R1427 1 No Bid
Calculator Paper Rolls 24" X 130 12 No Bid

3 Ring Notebooks 1” black 1 No Bid 2.54 3.35 1.90
1” white 1 No Bid 2.59 3.35 1.90
2” black 1 No Bid 13.27 4.88 3.43
2” white 1 No Bid 3.50 4.88 3.43
3” black 1 No Bid 4.83 6.55 3.83
3” white 1 No Bid 5.45 6.55 3.83
4” black 1 No Bid 5.57 10.43 15.07
4” white 1 No Bid 5.57 10.43 6.53
1" red 1 No Bid 3.39 4.80 5.09
1” blue 1 No Bid 3.84 4.80 5.09




1” Polytex Binder black 1 No Bid 7.35 8.34 9.39
Stapler Supplies Swingline #444 Stapler (no alternatives) 1 No Bid 8.11 14.89 8.07
Stanley Bostitch Staple Standard chisel point 5000 No Bid 1.10 3.50 3.50
HD 1/2” Staple 1000 No Bid 2.79 8.98 7.29
HD 3/8” Staple 1000 No Bid 2.63 8.95 6.52
HD 5/8” Staple 2500 No Bid 3.07 9.25 7.16
Staple Remover 1 No Bid 0.71 0.77 0.45

Paper Clips Regular 100 No Bid 0.28 0.42 0.29
Jumbo 100 No Bid 1.05 0.92 0.69
Paper Clip Holder/Dispenser , Magnetic 1 No Bid 1.64 1.96 3.13

Binder Clips Mini %" 12 No Bid 0.19 0.45 0.33
Small %" 12 No Bid 0.39 0.69 0.79
Medium 1 V4" 12 No Bid 0.90 0.85 0.67
Large 2” 12 No Bid 2.19 2.25 1.69

Fasteners

2 prong 2 % center 2" base, 2 hole

No Bid

8.00

4.50

Rubber Bands #19 3% x1/16 11b No Bid 4.60 4.62 3.45
#33 3% x1/8 11b No Bid 4.03 4.62 3.45
#54 Asst. 11b No Bid 1.59 4.62 3.45
#64 3% x1/4 11b No Bid 3.51 4.62 3.45

1.21

Prong Paper Fasteners, 2 3/4" Base, bases only

No Bid

3.68

3.07

2.10

Computer Diskette/CD CD-RW 700MB /80 minutes Recordable Media Spindle 25 No Bid 17.49 37.14 19.97
CD-R 700MB / 80 minutes Recordable Media Spindle 100 No Bid 18.06 35.78 19.97
DVD+R 4.7 GB / 120 minutes Recordable Media Spindle 100 No Bid 24.35 44.95 23.34
DVD+RW 4.7GB / 120 minutes Recordable Media Spindle 100 No Bid 76.00 44.95 22.43
DVD+RW 4.7GB / 120 Minutes Rewritable Media w/Slim Jewel 10 No Bid 31.97 18.84 17.89
Cases
Memorex CD/DVD Keepers Asst. Color (plastic) 25 No Bid 27.99 No Bid 5.79
Memorex CD/DVD Sleeves White (paper) 100 No Bid 5.37 5.52 3.95




Computer Labels AVES5160 Address labels, 1 x 2 5/8”, white 3000 No Bid 24.53 44.91 21.75
AVES5161 Address labels, 1 x 4, white 2000 No Bid 28.00 44.91 31.43
AVE52§6 File Folder Labels, 2/3 x 3 7/16 Assorted (blue, green, 750 No Bid 2785 20.37 14.49
red, white & yellow)
AVES5366 File Folder Labels, 2/3 x 3 7/16, white 1500 No Bid 14.62 36.31 36.25
AVEB8464 Shipping Labels, 3 1/3 x 4, white 600 No Bid 31.01 45.76 41.03
AVEO05452 Removable ID labels, 4 x 1 %%, white 150 No Bid 9.37 6.00 5.29
AVE30400 Labels 1x 2 % , white 3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Computer Cleaning Supplies Antistatic Monitor Screen Cleaning Wipes 80 No Bid 7.97 15.80 9.47
Can Air Duster 1 No Bid 4.94 7.50 9.34
Logitech Wireless Keyboard 1 No Bid 18.99 No Bid No Bid
Logitech Wireless Keyboard and Mouse Combo 1 No Bid 29.95 No Bid
Scotch Laminator Machine TL901X 1 No Bid 34.08 No Bid
Office Protective Mat, Large Mouse Mats, Non-Slip 23.6 x 13.7 1 No Bid 6.99 No Bid 7.14

Journals (log books)

300 pg green 12 1/8 x 7 5/8 double entry BOR66300J

No Bid

45.99

56.33

Data Binders Columnar Pad, 6 column, 8 1/2x11, green 1 No Bid 4.00 No Bid 11.39
\Iilnlf:IJirégNgaDlance Ledger Sheets, 9 1/4x11 7/8 green, Wilson Jones 100 No Bid 95.69 No Bid 40.59
Columnar Sheets 11x17, 30 columns , Wilson Jones WLJG5030 100 No Bid 64.20 No Bid 67.49
Pressboard data binders, 14 7/8x11, blue 1 No Bid No Bid 14.25 No Bid
Pressboard data binder 11x9 %, blue 1 No Bid No Bid 14.25 12.79
Pressboard Hanging Data Binder, 9 1/2x11, dark blue No Bid No Bid 14.25 17.29
Columnar Pad, side bound, 8 1/2x11, 3 columns, green 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.49

50.49

Clipboards

Letter size

No Bid

1.20

2.98

Calendars Calendar base 1 No Bid 4.83 21.50 5.59
Calendar refills 1 No Bid 3.10 3.99 7.03
Lg. desk pad Calendar 1 No Bid 4.55 6.49 5.19
20x30 monthly wall calendar 1 No Bid 23.00 26.56 24.79

H

0.92

Legal size

No Bid

1.75

3.20

3.39




Boxes [StorageBoxes LeterlLegal 32.47 1938

Pencils Mechanical Mechanical Pencils 0.7 mm Papermate PAP30301 (no exceptions) 12 No Bid 3.54 5.20 3.37
Mechanical Pencils 0.5 mm Papermate PAP61381 (no exceptions) 12 No Bid 5.16 No Bid 3.69
Pentel 0.5 mm black refills 1 No Bid 0.79 0.98 0.58
Pentel 0.7 mm black refills 1 No Bid 0.76 0.98 0.43

Pencils Wooden #2 Pencil 12 No Bid 1.10 1.94 1.18
Colored pencils, assorted 12 No Bid 1.42

Printer Ink & Toner HP 05A Black CE505A 1 104.75 79.38 No Bid 55.72
HP 12A Black Q2612A 1 92.20 67.60 No Bid 148.74
HP 26X Black CF226X 1 231.25 195.87 153.51
HP 38A Black Q1338A 1 31.00* 134.50 No Bid 165.06
HP 42X Black Q5942X 1 48.00* 278.00 237.24
HP 45 Black 51645A 1 15.00* 53.98 No Bid 56.94
HP 49A Black Q5949A 1 118.95 95.31 75.41
HP 55A Black CE255A 1 172.10 145.34 No Bid 88.99
HP 56 Black C6656AN 1 9.00* 47.40 36.54
HP 57 Tri-Color C6657AN 1 13.00* 47.40 No Bid 63.74
HP 58 Tri-Color C6658AN 1 20.00* No Bid 29.99
HP 72 Photo Black C9370A 1 95.05 111.00 No Bid 78.19
HP 72 Cyan C9371A 1 95.05 110.50 78.19
HP 72 Magenta C9372A 1 95.05 110.50 No Bid 78.19
HP 72 Yellow C9373A 1 95.05 110.70 78.19
HP 72 Gray C9374A 1 95.05 102.73 No Bid 78.19
HP 72 Matte Black C9403A 1 95.50 111.00 78.19
HP 78 Tri-Color C6578DN 1 15.00* No Bid No Bid 56.01
HP 80A Black CF280A 1 121.10 90.70 89.06
HP 85A Black CE285A 1 81.20 65.62 No Bid 56.33
HP 95 Tri-Color C8766WN 1 8.50 36.00 46.74
HP 97 Tri-Color C9363WN 1 10.00 12.91 No Bid 63.74
HP 98 Black C9364 WN 1 8.00 20.25 36.54

Fax Toner Brother PC201 1 32.80 31.10 NO Bid 30.94

Brother PC301 1 24.65 23.99 NO Bid 19.24
Brother Intellifax 2800 TN-250 Toner 1 23.00 No Bid NO Bid 42.99




Brother Intellifax 2800 DR-250 Drum 1 NO Bid 42.99
Brother Intellifax 2820 TN-350 Toner 1 NO Bid 66.92
Brother Intellifax 2820 DR-350 Drum 1 NO Bid 140.99
Brother Intellifax 2840 TN-450 Toner 1 NO Bid 69.91
Brother Intellifax 2840 DR-420 Drum 1
HP701/CC635A Fax Toner 1

Typewriter Ribbons / Lift-Off Tape |Lift-Off Typewriter Tape, IBM Wheelwriter Series, DPSR5111 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.99
Lift-Off Typewriter Tape, IBM Wheelwriter Series, DPSR5110 1 No Bid 20.46 No Bid 12.09
ggér:$able Film Typewriter Ribbon, IBM 670X Selectric 1ll, Porelon 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.99
Nakajima AE-710 Ribbons, DPSR7310 1 21.00

Typewriter Lift-Off Tape 86L

Highlighters Yellow Broad Tip Highlighter 12 No Bid 2.60 4.56 2.79
Green Broad Tip Highlighter 12 No Bid 6.10 6.10 2.85
Pink Broad Tip Highlighter 12 No Bid 6.10 6.10 2.87
Blue Borad Tip Highlighter 12 No Bid 6.10 6.10 2.87
Orange Broad Tip Highlighter 12 No Bid 6.20 6.10 2.89
Assorted, Pen Style (blue,green,orange, pink,yellow, purple) 12 No Bid 6.81 3.65 2.83

Markers Sanford Sharpie, Fine Pt, Black SAN30001 12 7.71 13.98 9.11
Sanford Sharpie,Fine Pt, Red SAN30002 12 No Bid 7.71 13.98 9.15
Sanford Sharpie, Fine Pt, Blue SAN30003 12 No Bid 7.71 13.98 9.15
Sanford Sharpie, Extra-Fine Pt, Black SAN37001 12 No Bid 7.65 13.98 9.45
Permanent Marker, Chisel Tip Wide, Black 12 No Bid 8.68 13.98 9.29
Dry Erase Markers, Chisel Tip, assorted (red, black, blue,green) 4/pk No Bid 3.28 6.58 4.59
EXPO Dry-Erase Markers, Chisel Tip, Black 12/pk

Pens BIC Stick, medium pt, Barrel,1.0 mm black 12 1.28 2.89 1.05
BIC Stick, medium pt, Barrel, 1.0 mm blue 12 No Bid 1.28 2.89 1.05
BIC Stick, medium pt, Barrel, 1.0 mm red 12 No Bid 1.45 2.89 1.05
BIC Stick, fine pt, Barrel 0.8 black 12 No Bid 1.28 2.89 1.08
BIC Stick, fine pt, Barrel 0.8 blue 12 No Bid 1.06 2.89 1.03
BIC Stick, fine pt, Barrel 0.8 red 12 No Bid 2.04 2.89 1.03
Bic BU3 Grip retractable Ball point Pen Medium 1.0 black 12 No Bid 4.60 No Bid 3.60
Bic BU3 Grip retractable Ball point Pen Medium 1.0 blue 12 No Bid 4.50 6.89 3.48
Paper Mate Gel Pen, Retractable Pen 1.0 mm Black 12 No Bid 4.99 21.48 4.89
Paper Mate Gel Pen, Retractable Pen 1.0 mm Blue 12 No Bid 4.99 21.48 4.99




Paper Mate Gel Pen, Retractable Pen 1.0 mm Red 12 No Bid 4.27 21.48 1.74
Sharpie S Gel Medium Point 0.7 mm Black 12 No Bid 9.10 18.24 8.49
Sharpie S Gel Medium Point 0.7 mm Blue 12 No Bid 9.10 18.24 8.49
Sharpie S Gel Medium Point 0.7 mm Red No Bid 9.10 18.24 8.49
Uni-ball Onyx Rollerball Pens, Fine Point 0.7 mm Black 12 No Bid 7.15 7.60 No Bid
Uni-ball Onyx Rollerball Pens, Fine Point 0.7 mm Blue 12 No Bid 7.15 7.60 No Bid
Uni-ball Onyx Rollerball Pens, Fine Point 0.7 mm Red 12 7.15 7.60 No Bid
Stay Put type Replacement Pen, black 1 1.48 1.56
Stay Put type Pen with Base, black 1 2.89 1.07

Counterfeit detector pens

1 (pk/3)

(920931)

Paper 20# 8 2 x 11, White Case 38.64 44.90 40.99
20#, 8 V2 x 11, White 3 hole punched Case 53.41 77.00 44.24
20# 8% x 14, White Case 68.01 78.00 62.24
20# 8 Y2 x 14, White Ream No Bid 7.83 7.80 8.01
20# 11x17 White Case No Bid 53.10 65.00 57.69
20# 11x17 white Ream No Bid 11.40 6.50 14.54
67# 8 2 x11, Ivory, Vellum Ream No Bid 10.70 23.90 8.99
67# 8 Y2 x 11, White, Vellum Ream No Bid 8.50 23.90 8.99
30# 9 x 12 1/2, Blue Manuscript, Southworth 41SM Box No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Blue Ream No Bid 6.93 11.41 8.55
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Green Ream No Bid 6.93 11.41 8.25
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Canary Ream 7.13 6.93 11.41 No bid
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Goldenrod Ream 7.88 6.93 11.41 7.95
20# 8 %2 x 11 Color Bond, Pink Ream 7.41 6.93 11.41 7.95
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Ivory Ream 8.69 6.93 11.41 8.80
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Gray Ream 8.70 6.93 11.41 8.80
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Lilac Ream 8.05 6.93 11.41 7.95
20# 8 /2 x 11 Color Bond, Cherry Ream No Bid 6.93 11.41 No bid
HP C1860A DesignJet Bond Wide Format Roll 24 x 150 24 Ibs. 1 Each 33.60 25.00 No Bid 28.94
;|4P£1861A Bright White Bond Wide Format Roll, Matte 36 x 150, 1 Each 51.75 69.00 No Bid 44.57
HP Universal Inkjet Bond Paper Roll, Uncoated, 36" x 150 4185 26.00 No Bid 31.36




Post-it flags

Asst Arrow Flags

100

No Bid

3.56

5.65

3.49

Arrow Flags, “Sign Here”

120

No Bid

3.99

Time Clock Supplies Lathem 4001 / 2121 Time Clock Ribbon, LTH72CN 1 No Bid 10.94 11.29 14.09
Lathem 1000E Time Clock Ribbon, VIS6008 1 No Bid 14.06 13.10 15.27
Tops Time Cards TOP1275 500 No Bid 26.99 34.91 36.89
Acroprint ES1010 Time Cards ACP099111000 100 No Bid 19.69 30.49 22.89

Clock and Calendar

Misc Scissors 1 No Bid 2.10 2.58 1.29
12” single edge wood ruler 1 No Bid 0.55 0.95 0.49
Gold foil notary & cert seals 44/pk No Bid 3.70 No Bid 8.19
Reinforcements, % hole punched hole, wht 1000 No Bid 3.99 2.85 4.79
ggl(\:/lk520109 Embossed Vinyl Labeling Tape, .38 x 9.8, Glossy 1 No Bid 3.70 4.98 599
DYM30251 LabelWriter Labels 1 1/8 x 3 V2, White 2 rls/pk No Bid 7.50 18.56 7.97
Chair mat 45x53 wide lip (low pile carpet) 1 No Bid 33.99 98.00 98.95
Expo dry eraser 1 No Bid 2.68 3.58 3.99
Expo cleaner 8oz 1 No Bid 2.30 4.69 2.86
Rolodex 1 No Bid 23.00 No Bid 29.95
Laminating Pouches 5 mil 8 ¥2 x 11 100/bx No Bid 10.00 No Bid 25.09
2 hole punch 1 No Bid 7.99 8.68 8.42
3 hole punch (10 sheet capacity) 1 No Bid 5.92 9.25 7.25
Hanging File Folder Tabs Clear, 1/3 cut 25/pk No Bid 1.67 3.75 2.69
Softalk Coiled Phone Cords 25 ft Black 1 No Bid 3.88 No Bid 9.83
Pushpins, clear 100/pk No Bid 0.87 1.95 1.56
Self-Inking Stamp Refill Ink, 1 oz, Black 1 No Bid 1.90 4.68 7.09
Self-Inking Stamp Refill Ink, 10z, Blue 1 No Bid 1.89 4.68 7.09
Self-Inking Stamp Refill Ink, 1 oz, Red 1 No Bid 1.89 4.68 7.09
Auto Feed Cross Cut Paper Shredder Heavy Duty 12 sheet 1 No Bid 49.00 No Bid 78.70
Sharp EL-11197PIll Heavy Duty Color Printing Calculator with 1 No Bid 83.24 No Bid 102.36

Batteries AA 24 No Bid 7.70 21.49 10.33
AAA 24 No Bid 7.99 20.49 12.71
9 Volt 12 No Bid 13.80 30.62 19.02
D 12 No Bid 8.99 20.56 16.78
C 12 No Bid 7.00 20.56 13.17

Printed Stationary Letterheads (3 Color Ink) 500 No Bid 189.00 No Bid No Bid
500 29.99
Busi No Bid No Bid No Bid
usiness Cards 1000 o Bi 35.19 i i




500 75.00
1000 78.19
Return Envelopes W/Window No Bid No Bid No Bid
2500 164.07
5000 276.25
500 61.27
1000 77.08
Return Envelopes W/O Window No Bid No Bid No Bid
2500 142.34
5000 229.63
Notary Stamps 1 No Bid 54.17 60.95 No Bid
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